
Sept 3 for Sept 7 
Whist: Tonight, Friday September 7, in the Village Hall at 7.30pm, our usual 
fortnightly whist drive with raffle. Refreshments included. 
 
Bike and Hike: Tomorrow Saturday, September 8, Beds and Herts Churches Trust 
“Bike and Hike” will take place, from 10am until 6pm. Half the money raised goes to 
the Churches Trust and the other half to our own Church. Sponsor forms from 
Graeme 01767 646187 or available from the Church. 
 
Church Lunch: Thursday, September 13, there will be the monthly Church lunch at 
12.30pm in the church. Names please to Betty, 01767 640734, by Monday 10 
September. 
 
Emm Gee 60: MrsRawlins, Chairman, presided  at the monthly meeting held on 
Wednesday last, and was caller for prize bingo.  
One new member was welcomed and Pat was given her Birthday gift , having 
reached the grand age of ninety years a few days before. Winners of the raffle held 
were Mr A Buck, Mrs E Bridge, Mrs P Buck, Mrs J Harding, Mr E Barrance, Mrs K 
Flint, Mr D Burley Mrs P Burley. During the afternoon tea was served. The next 
meeting will be held on Wednesday October 31, in the Village Hall at 2.30pm. As 
always new members will be welcome. 
 
Quiz night: The next fund raising event in the Village Hall will be our quiz night on 
Saturday, September 22. A two course meal will be served around 7pm, doors open 
6.30pm.  There will also be a raffle and a licensed bar. Tickets are £9 and available 
from Carolyn 01767 640727, Jackie 01767 640790, Coral 01767 641112, Doreen 
01767 640114. 
 
Yard Sale: There will be a yard sale in a number of gardens around the village on 
Friday, Saturday and Sunday, October 19, 20 and 21. If you would like to sell 
unwanted items on your own drive and share the cost of an advert in the local paper 
please contact Bob Ford on 01767 641222, before September 12. 
 
Church Services: Sunday, Sept 9, Family service, 10am 


